
Eurocopter and the Civil Aviation Flight University  of China commence China’s 
very first helicopter ab-initio technician training  program to meet the needs of the 

country’s burgeoning aviation sector 
 

 
Beijing, China, 28 October 2011 
 
The Civil Aviation Flight University of China (CAFU C) begins its first helicopter ab-initio 
technician training class with 15 students, signall ing the start of a long-term plan devised 
by Eurocopter and CAFUC to develop a pool of qualif ied helicopter technicians to meet 
China’s future needs in the expanding general aviat ion sector.  
 
In an opening ceremony held on 26 October, senior representatives from the Civil Aviation 
Authority of China (CAAC), the French and German Consulates, as well as CAFUC and 
Eurocopter China were present at the CAFUC campus in Guanghan, Sichuan Province, to mark 
the commencement of ab-initio technician training courses for students to become qualified 
helicopter technicians and pursue a career in the industry. 
 
“Safety has always been a top priority for Eurocopter, and proper training is essential to 
ensuring the utmost safety in helicopter operations,” stated Eurocopter China CEO Bruno 
Boulnois.  “We have joined hands with CAFUC to train technicians in China, as CAFUC is a key 
training organization within CAAC, the highest authority in flight safety and aviation development 
in the country.  With CAFUC’s proven expertise and competence in aviation training, this co-
operation marks another milestone in Eurocopter’s long-standing relationship and presence in 
China supporting the helicopter market and serving its customers.” 
 
The Memorandum of Understanding (MoU) between Eurocopter and CAFUC was signed in July 
2010, with the aim of training 120 helicopter technicians annually by 2015. In the “train the 
trainer” scheme, Eurocopter provides training to CAFUC instructors both in China (one month) 
and its training academy in Germany (three months), to certify them to the highest international 
standards as qualified instructors to provide ab-initio technician training to students in CAFUC. 
 
Describing it as a win-win situation for both Eurocopter and CAFUC, CAFUC President Zheng 
Xiaoyong said, “Our instructors get to learn from the best in the industry, and in turn, we are 
able to train many more students to prepare them for a career in a sector that is poised to grow 
rapidly as China begins to open up its low-altitude airspace in the coming years.” 
 
The course will last for four months, during which each trainee will receive 350 hours of 
theoretical and 300 hours of practical training in the technical aspects and functions of a 
helicopter.  Upon completion and passing a CAAC-approved test, the trainee will receive a basic 
helicopter maintenance technician license.  Thereafter, he will be able to seek employment with 
helicopter companies and operators, during which he can then further obtain type-rating 
certification to progress in his career.  
 
“Proper ab-initio training is absolutely crucial, as it not only provides the foundation for trainees 
to further improve their skills in tandem with on-the-job experience, but also in the development 
of the aviation industry,” said Detlef Ehrig, head of Eurocopter Training Academy based in 
Kassel, Germany.  “In a fast-growing market like China, this foundation has to be built early, so 
that the growth of the industry will not be hampered by the lack of ab-initio trained technicians 
and pilots.”  



 
In a sign of commitment to the Chinese helicopter market, Eurocopter China will continue to 
invest in training activities in co-operation with local organizations.  “In time to come, China will 
become one of the world’s largest aviation markets, and top-level training is key to its future 
development,” concluded Boulnois. 
 
 
About Eurocopter   
Established in 1992, the Franco-German-Spanish Eurocopter Group is a division of EADS, a 
world leader in aerospace, defense and related services. The Eurocopter Group employs 
approximately 17,500 people. In 2010, Eurocopter confirmed its position as the world’s number 
one helicopter manufacturer in the civil and parapublic market with a turnover of 4.8 billion 
Euros, orders for 346 new helicopters and a 49 percent market share in the civil and parapublic 
sectors. Overall, the Group’s helicopters account for 33 percent of the total worldwide civil and 
parapublic fleet. Eurocopter’s strong worldwide presence is ensured by its 30 subsidiaries and 
participations on five continents, along with a dense network of distributors, certified agents and 
maintenance centers. There are currently 11,360 Eurocopter helicopters in service and some 
2,900 customers in 149 countries. Eurocopter offers the largest civil and military helicopter range 
in the world.  

Website: www.eurocopter.com 
 
About Eurocopter China                                                                                                             
Created in December 2006, Eurocopter China is a wholly-owned subsidiary of Eurocopter 
Group, responsible for sales and customer support activities for the company’s entire range of 
products. In China, Eurocopter China covers a market share of 40%. With over 40 years of 
presence and 30 years of experience in industrial cooperation in China, more than 160 
Eurocopter helicopters have been sold in the country. In order to provide quality service in 
proximity to Chinese operators, Eurocopter China has established a multi-based organization in 
Beijing, Shanghai, Shenzhen, Harbin, Chengdu, Wuhan and Hong Kong staffed with around 55 
employees.  

 
Website: www.eurocopter-china.com 
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